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Stay up-to-date with the growing amount of reference resources available online

How important is the World Wide Web to information retrieval and communication? Important enough that
information professionals have seen students exit from their libraries en masse when Internet service was
lost. Internet providers dominate the indexing and abstracting of periodical articles as major publishers now
offer nearly all of their reference titles in digital form. Libraries spend increasing amounts of funding on
electronic reference materials, and librarians devote an increasing amount of time to assisting in their use.
The Reference Collection: From the Shelf to the Web is an essential guide to collection development for
electronic materials in academic and public libraries.

The Reference Collection: From the Shelf to the Web tracks the continuing evolution of electronic reference
resources-and how they’re accessed—in a variety of settings. Librarians representing university, elementary
school, and public libraries in the United States and Australia examine how reference collections have
evolved over time (and may soon be a thing of the past); how public and school libraries have dealt with the
changes; why library research assignments have become more difficult for teachers to make and for students
to complete; how to organize online reference sources; and why the nature of plagiarism has changed in the
electronic era. The book also examines the use of electronic references from a publisher’s perspective and
looks at the most important Web-accessible reference tools—both free and subscription—in the areas of
humanities, medicine, the social sciences, business, and education.

The Reference Collection: From the Shelf to the Web also examines:

issues of authority, accessibility, cost, comfort, and user education in evaluating electronic resources●

the formation of purchasing consortia to facilitate the transfer of reference materials from print to online●

formats
current literature and research findings on the state of digital versus print reference collections●

what electronic publishing means to smaller reference books (dictionaries, almanacs, etc.)●

the need for increased information literacy among students●

the nature, extent, and causes of cyber plagiarism●

the use of federated search tools●

and includes a selected list of the top 100 free Internet reference sites●

The Reference Collection: From the Shelf to the Web is an essential resource for all reference and collection
development librarians, and an invaluable aid for publishing professionals.
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From reader reviews:

Maxine Elam:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be revise about what going on or details even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe
will update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems coming to
an individual is you don't know what one you should start with. This The Reference Collection: From the
Shelf to the Web is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what
you want and wish in this era.

James Brown:

This book untitled The Reference Collection: From the Shelf to the Web to be one of several books in which
best seller in this year, here is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You
will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail store or you can order it through online. The publisher
with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read this book
in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this guide from your list.

Irma Murray:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their down time with their family,
or all their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic in
the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to fill
your current free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book is usually option to fill your cost-free time/ holiday.
The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to consider look
for book, may be the reserve untitled The Reference Collection: From the Shelf to the Web can be good book
to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

John Yang:

You could spend your free time to learn this book this reserve. This The Reference Collection: From the
Shelf to the Web is simple to develop you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and also soon.
If you did not get much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make
you better to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that
you will get when one buys this book.
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