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The second edition of a bestseller, Soil and Water Chemistry: An Integrative Approach maintains the
balanced perspective that made the first edition a hugely popular textbook. The second edition includes new
figures and tables, new chapters, and expanded exercises in each chapter. It covers topics including soil
chemical environment, soil minerals, soil organic matter, cation exchange, oxidation-reduction, mineral
weathering and solubility, surface chemistry and adsorption reactions, acidity and salinity in soil materials,
and chemical thermodynamics applied to soil systems.

See What’s New in the Second Edition:

Extensive section that details the sources, speciation, and the general behavior of elements in soils●

Expanded section on crystal structure, updated phyllosillcates classifications scheme, inclusion of●

sepiolite-palygorskite group, and expanded x-ray diffraction section
Discussion of surface runoff losses of phosphorus from soil and description of the inductivity coupled●

argon plasma-mass spectroscopy (ICP-MS) analytical technique for determining elemental concentrations
in soil solution
Coverage of the influence of redox processes on the soil chemistry of nonelectroactive elements●

Description of the electrokinetic phenomenon and investigation of the influence of temperature on●

adsorption
Expanded discussion on the application of chemical thermodynamics to soil systems●

A solutions manual is available upon qualifying course adoption.

Still one of the only texts on this subject, this book provides a comprehensive, modern, and balanced
coverage of the chemical and mineralogical characteristics of soils and their chemical processes. It contains
more information and topic coverage than required for an average, single-semester course. This extensive
coverage is by design, giving you the latitude to pick your own essential topics while providing additional
information or a more advanced treatment when needed. Figures and tables make the information accessible
and each problem has been tested and is relevant and doable, but asks more of students than to simply
generate a number. This format allows students to understand the concepts and recognize that their



computations have physical meaning.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Bunnell:

Here thing why this kind of Soil and Water Chemistry: An Integrative Approach, Second Edition are
different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all examining a book is good but it really depends in the
content of the usb ports which is the content is as scrumptious as food or not. Soil and Water Chemistry: An
Integrative Approach, Second Edition giving you information deeper since different ways, you can find any
guide out there but there is no book that similar with Soil and Water Chemistry: An Integrative Approach,
Second Edition. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing
which happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere
like in area, café, or even in your approach home by train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the
printed book maybe the form of Soil and Water Chemistry: An Integrative Approach, Second Edition in e-
book can be your alternate.

Henry Knight:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Attempt
to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't judge book by its include may doesn't work
this is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside seem likes.
Maybe you answer may be Soil and Water Chemistry: An Integrative Approach, Second Edition why
because the great cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint you. The inside or
content is fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly show you to pick up
this book.

Frances Sitz:

Reading a book to be new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you
examine a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, due to the fact book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on
what types of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your study, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, such us
novel, comics, along with soon. The Soil and Water Chemistry: An Integrative Approach, Second Edition
provide you with a new experience in studying a book.

Sandra Lester:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the
best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is known as of book
Soil and Water Chemistry: An Integrative Approach, Second Edition. Contain your knowledge by it. Without
leaving behind the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is
most essential that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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