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Previous works on Southern African law have been directed primarily to lawyers and students of law within
Southern Africa; this is the first major text on the topic written for use in common law countries. The book
identifies and describes judgments in Southern Africa courts that are significant for their treatment of
conflicts and tort issues and can serve as authorities or models in common law jurisdictions. The most
important legislative reforms in related subjects are also described. The text provides lawyers in common
law countries access to the Southern African cases and statutes most pertinent to questions of conflict of laws
and torts that arise in common law jurisdiction.

The judgments surveyed span the years 1947 to the present. Most are from South Africa and Zimbabwe
(before and after independence), Botswana, Lesotho, Swaziland, and South West Africa/Namibia; the South
African national states are also represented. Helpful English-language commentaries on cases and statutes
discussed in the text are cited in the notes. Quick reference tables of cases and statutes, and indexes of
principal works cited and abbrevations complete this useful guide. This invaluable sourcebook will allow
lawyers and scholars in common law countries to benefit from recognition and appropriate use of Southern
Africa's contributions to the common law in torts and conflict of laws.
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From reader reviews:

Frank Hall:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the publication entitled Common Law in Southern Africa: Conflict of Laws and
Torts Precedents (Contributions in Legal Studies). Try to the actual book Common Law in Southern Africa:
Conflict of Laws and Torts Precedents (Contributions in Legal Studies) as your good friend. It means that it
can for being your friend when you sense alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than ever
before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you
can know every thing by the book. So , we need to make new experience in addition to knowledge with this
book.

Emma O\'Neill:

The guide with title Common Law in Southern Africa: Conflict of Laws and Torts Precedents (Contributions
in Legal Studies) posesses a lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of help after read
this book. That book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this book represented the condition of
the world today. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This particular book
will bring you inside new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you
can read the item anywhere you want.

Romana Linder:

The actual book Common Law in Southern Africa: Conflict of Laws and Torts Precedents (Contributions in
Legal Studies) has a lot details on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of profit. The book
was published by the very famous author. Tom makes some research previous to write this book. This kind
of book very easy to read you can get the point easily after perusing this book.

Miriam Normandin:

A lot of people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the
idea when they get a half regions of the book. You can choose often the book Common Law in Southern
Africa: Conflict of Laws and Torts Precedents (Contributions in Legal Studies) to make your current reading
is interesting. Your own skill of reading proficiency is developing when you including reading. Try to
choose simple book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the idea about book and examining
especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to wide open a book and learn it. Beside that the book
Common Law in Southern Africa: Conflict of Laws and Torts Precedents (Contributions in Legal Studies)
can to be a newly purchased friend when you're feel alone and confuse with what must you're doing of this
time.
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