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Famoso pelas suas bem-sucedidas adaptações para a televisão, em 1976/77, pela TV Globo, e, em 2004/05,
pela TV Record, o romance "A Escrava Isaura", escrito por Bernardo Guimarães (1825-1884), tem uma
heroína que consegue ampla empatia do público: uma escrava branca, educada, perseguida por um vilão
terrível, seu proprietário Leôncio. A obra alcançou grande êxito em sua época. Lançada em 1875, obteve
repercussão pela sua história em tom de folhetim e pela mensagem abolicionista. Era previsível, aliás, que as
desventuras de sua protagonista, tratada como negra, embora branca, fosse tomada como símbolo do
combate ao sistema escravista. A repercussão foi tamanha, que o imperador dom Pedro 2o, ao visitar Ouro
Preto, fez questão de visitar Guimarães.
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From reader reviews:

Terry Grissom:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important for people. The book A Escrava Isaura (Portuguese Edition) seemed to
be making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It doesn't
matter what advantages for you. The guide A Escrava Isaura (Portuguese Edition) is not only giving you
much more new information but also to become your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your
personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship using the book A Escrava Isaura
(Portuguese Edition). You never sense lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Gene Kirkland:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
routine give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge your information inside
the book that improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of e-
book you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want experience happy
read one using theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The actual A Escrava Isaura (Portuguese
Edition) is kind of reserve which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Catherine Stoltenberg:

The particular book A Escrava Isaura (Portuguese Edition) has a lot info on it. So when you read this book
you can get a lot of advantage. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The author makes some
research just before write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can get the point easily after
reading this book.

Scott Padilla:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside using friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, you
think reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It okay you can have
the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like A Escrava Isaura (Portuguese Edition)
which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.
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