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This book examines 200 contractual problems which regularly arise on building and engineering projects and
provides a detailed explanation of their solutions, citing standard contract conditions and key parts of legal
judgements as authority. A succinct summary is provided at the end of each detailed solution.

It covers problems together with their solutions in respect of:

Procurement matters●

Tenders and bidding●

Design issues●

Letters of intent●

Contractor's programme●

Contractor's float●

Delays●

Concurrent Delays●

Extensions of time●

Liquidated/delay damages●

Unliquidated damages●

Variations●

Loss and expense/additional cost claims●

Acceleration●

Global claims●

Payment●

Damage to the works●

Exclusion clauses●

Retention of title●

Practical completion●

Defect correction●

Adjudication●

This book deals with a broad range of construction contracts including JCT Standard Form and Design and
Build, New Engineering Contract NEC3, ICE and GC/Works/1.

This book was first published under the title of One Hundred Contractual Problems and Their Solutions,
with a second edition entitled One Hundred and Fifty Contractual Problems and their Solutions. This third
edition adds 50 new problems and replaces 15 of those in the last edition. Of the remainder half have been
the subject of revision.

"Deserves a place on every site and in every office as the standard handbook on contractual problems"
—Construction Law Digest
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From reader reviews:

Grace Moreno:

Do you considered one of people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained inside the straightway,
hold on guys this specific aren't like that. This 200 Contractual Problems and their Solutions book is readable
by means of you who hate the straight word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable
looking at experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer
of 200 Contractual Problems and their Solutions content conveys thinking easily to understand by many
individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the information but it just different available as it. So
, do you nevertheless thinking 200 Contractual Problems and their Solutions is not loveable to be your top
checklist reading book?

Kathy Natal:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this 200 Contractual Problems and their
Solutions publication written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that could be
understand by anyone who have read the book. Written within good manner for you, leaking every ideas and
creating skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still skepticism 200 Contractual
Problems and their Solutions as good book not just by the cover but also from the content. This is one guide
that can break don't judge book by its protect, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this
particular!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to one
more sixth sense.

Charles Barton:

This 200 Contractual Problems and their Solutions is great publication for you because the content which can
be full of information for you who else always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute.
This book reveal it data accurately using great arrange word or we can state no rambling sentences included.
So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight
forward sentences but hard core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having 200 Contractual
Problems and their Solutions in your hand like getting the world in your arm, information in it is not
ridiculous 1. We can say that no reserve that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen minute right but this
guide already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt
this?

Michael Torres:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book has been rare? Why so
many concern for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes
reading, not only science book and also novel and 200 Contractual Problems and their Solutions or maybe
others sources were given information for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel would like to
read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those books are



helping them to increase their knowledge. In various other case, beside science book, any other book likes
200 Contractual Problems and their Solutions to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book
like this one.
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