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In there four incisive and keenly perceptive essays, one of out most celebrated and respected historians of
modern Europe looks at the world situation and some of the major political problems confronting us at the
start of the third millennium.

With his usual measured and brilliant historical perspective, Eric Hobsbawm traces the rise of American
hegemony in the twenty-first century. He examines the state of steadily increasing world disorder in the
context of rapidly growing inequalities created by rampant free-market globalization. He makes clear that
there is no longer a plural power system of states whose relations are governed by common laws--including
those for the conduct of war. He scrutinizes America's policies, particularly its use of the threat of terrorism
as an excuse for unilateral deployment of its global power. Finally, he discusses the ways in which the
current American hegemony differs from the defunct British Empire in its inception, its ideology, and its
effects on nations and individuals.

Hobsbawm is particularly astute in assessing the United States' assertion of world hegemony, its
denunciation of formerly accepted international conventions, and its launching of wars of aggression when it
sees fit. Aside from the naivete and failure that have surrounded most of these imperial campaigns,
Hobsbawm points out that foreign values and institutions--including those associated with a democratic
government--can rarely be imposed on countries such as Iraq by outside forces unless the conditions exist
that make them acceptable and readily adaptable.

Timely and accessible, On Empire is a commanding work of history that should be read by anyone who
wants some understanding of the turbulent times in which we live.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Marian Jackson:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take
a walk, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book called On Empire:
America, War, and Global Supremacy? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You understand beside you
can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with it has the
opinion or you have different opinion?

Steven Murray:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content.
To be sure that book is very important for us. The book On Empire: America, War, and Global Supremacy
ended up being making you to know about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It is
very advantages for you. The reserve On Empire: America, War, and Global Supremacy is not only giving
you a lot more new information but also being your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your
personal spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship together with the book On Empire:
America, War, and Global Supremacy. You never sense lose out for everything when you read some books.

Marilynn Johnson:

The particular book On Empire: America, War, and Global Supremacy will bring that you the new
experience of reading a book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. When you try to find new
book to read, this book very ideal to you. The book On Empire: America, War, and Global Supremacy is
much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can more
easily to read the book.

Meghan Drucker:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got learners? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And you also know
that little person just like reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important and book as to be the point. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your current
teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update about something by book. Different categories of
books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is this On Empire: America, War, and Global
Supremacy.
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