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An all-new series based on the hit Ubisoft(R) video game franchise "Assassin's Creed." Part historical
fiction, part tie-in, this novel creates an all-new narrative fans of the video games will love.

Nothing in Owen's life has been right since his father died in prison, accused of a crime Owen is certain he
didn't commit. Monroe, the IT guy at school, might finally bring Owen the means to clear his father's name
by letting him use an Animus-a device that lets users explore genetic memories buried within their own
DNA. During a simulation, Owen comes uncovers the existence of a powerful relic long considered a
legend-the Trident of Eden. Now two secret organizations will stop at nothing to take possession of this
artifact-the Brotherhood of Assassins and the Templar Order. It becomes clear the only way to save himself
is to find the Trident first.

Under the guidance of Monroe, Owen and a group of other teenagers go into a memory they all share within
their DNA: the 1863 Draft Riots in New York City. Owen and his companions will find themselves tested on
the violent streets of New York, and their experiences in the past will have far-reaching consequences in the
present.
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From reader reviews:

John McDole:

What do you think of book? It is just for students as they are still students or the item for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that question above. Every
person has various personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that
they don't would like do that. You must know how great and important the book Last Descendants: An
Assassin's Creed Novel Series. All type of book could you see on many sources. You can look for the
internet solutions or other social media.

Wilbert Westerfield:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also work as a life style. This
reading behavior give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge your
information inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get
based on what kind of publication you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with training books but
if you want truly feel happy read one together with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Typically
the Last Descendants: An Assassin's Creed Novel Series is kind of book which is giving the reader
unforeseen experience.

Joyce Cannon:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the spare time or they will get
great deal of stress from both way of life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will
say absolutely sure. People is human not only a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you
have when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever try this
one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the actual book you have read
is Last Descendants: An Assassin's Creed Novel Series.

Herbert Knight:

You can find this Last Descendants: An Assassin's Creed Novel Series by browse the bookstore or Mall.
Simply viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for the knowledge.
Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only simply by written or printed but also can you enjoy this book
simply by e-book. In the modern era just like now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and
searching what their problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your e-
book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose
suitable ways for you.
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