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A classic thriller from New York Times bestselling author Jeffery Deaver featuring the intricate forensic
detail, masterful plot twists, and harrowing breakneck pace that made A Maiden's Grave, The Bone
Collector, and The Coffin Dancer national bestsellers.

It's New Year's Eve, December 31, 1999, and Washington, D.C., is under siege. Early in the day, a grisly
machine gun attack in the Dupont Circle Metro station leaves dozens dead and the city crippled with fear. A
note delivered to the mayor's office pins the massacre on the Digger, a robotlike assassin programmed to
wreak havoc on the capital every four hours—until midnight. Only a ransom of $20 million delivered to the
Digger's accomplice—and mastermind—will end the death and terror. But the Digger becomes a far more
sinister threat when his accomplice is killed in a freak accident while en route to the money drop. With the
ransom note as the single scrap of evidence, Special Agent Margaret Lukas calls upon Parker Kincaid, a
retired FBI agent and the top forensic document examiner in the country. Somehow, by midnight, they must
find the Digger—before he finds them.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Edick:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice
simply by surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated the idea for a while is
reading. That's why, by reading a book your ability to survive raise then having chance to remain than other
is high. For you personally who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific The Devil's
Teardrop: A Novel Of The Last Night Of The Century book as starter and daily reading publication. Why,
because this book is usually more than just a book.

Michelle Saunders:

The reason? Because this The Devil's Teardrop: A Novel Of The Last Night Of The Century is an unordinary
book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap it but latter it will zap you with the secret the item
inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who all write the book in such amazing way makes
the content interior easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is
good for you because of not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book
will give you a lot of rewards than the other book have got such as help improving your talent and your
critical thinking means. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I were you I will go to the publication
store hurriedly.

Stacey Ryan:

The Devil's Teardrop: A Novel Of The Last Night Of The Century can be one of your nice books that are
good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that may
increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information.
The copy writer giving his/her effort to set every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing The Devil's
Teardrop: A Novel Of The Last Night Of The Century nevertheless doesn't forget the main point, giving the
reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This
great information could drawn you into new stage of crucial imagining.

Stephen Mosley:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got scholars? We believe that that question
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And you also
know that little person such as reading or as studying become their hobby. You need to know that reading is
very important as well as book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
current teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update regarding something by book. Different
categories of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is this The Devil's Teardrop: A
Novel Of The Last Night Of The Century.
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