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In the fall of 1998, George Cantor and his wife sent off their bright, funny, enthusiastic, 18-year-old
daughter, Courtney, to the University of Michigan as a freshman. Six weeks later, the university called
Cantor to claim her corpse. Courtney fell from her sixth-floor dormitory window after being served drinks
illegally at a fraternity party.
The events surrounding her death were featured on the CBS news magazine 48 Hours. In Cantor's grief over
losing Courtney, he sank into a bitter and prolonged depression that led him to question the value of his own
life and newspaper career. This ended after a year when he was diagnosed with cancer, at which point the
value of life suddenly and stunningly was renewed.
Emotional and reportorial, a mix of grief therapy, celebration of life, mystery, and social criticism,
Courtney's Legacy addresses the reality of death, but views the issue from the other end of the life cycle.
How do parents and friends deal with the loss of a young woman whose life was so full of promise?
Courtney's Legacy also serves as an alarm for parents, being a tough examination of how university housing,
legal, and social policies helped to create a situation that made Courtney's death a tragedy waiting to happen.
Cantor eloquently unfolds his and Courtney's story, one of death, loss, and renewal, revealing that learning
that acceptance of the past and celebration of the present is the only way to endure in our increasingly
complex world.
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From reader reviews:

Erma Carver:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students as they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't want do that. You must know how great along with important the book Courtney's Legacy: A Father's
Journey. All type of book could you see on many resources. You can look for the internet options or other
social media.

Ruth Beasley:

This Courtney's Legacy: A Father's Journey book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the world is in
your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is definitely information inside this book incredible
fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This particular
Courtney's Legacy: A Father's Journey without we understand teach the one who studying it become critical
in contemplating and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Courtney's Legacy: A Father's Journey can bring
when you are and not make your handbag space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it in the
lovely laptop even cell phone. This Courtney's Legacy: A Father's Journey having great arrangement in word
and also layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Salvador Swain:

The book untitled Courtney's Legacy: A Father's Journey contain a lot of information on that. The writer
explains your ex idea with easy method. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do
not necessarily worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by famous author. The author will
bring you in the new period of time of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can
continue reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime.
In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their official web-site along with order it. Have
a nice examine.

Richard Harden:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is written or printed or illustrated from each source that will filled update of
news. Within this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From
media social including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
looking for the Courtney's Legacy: A Father's Journey when you needed it?
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