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Winner of the 2012 Helen Hull Award, presented by the National Garden Clubs.

Midwestern gardeners and landscapers are becoming increasingly attracted to noninvasive regional native
wildflowers and plants over popular nonnative species. TheMidwestern Native Garden offers viable
alternatives to both amateurs and professionals, whether they are considering adding a few native plants or
intending to go native all the way. Native plants improve air and water quality, reduce use of pesticides, and
provide vital food and reproductive sites to birds and butterflies, that nonnative plants cannot offer, helping
bring back a healthy ecosystem.

The authors provide a comprehensive selection of native alternatives that look similar or even identical to a
range of nonnative ornamentals. These are native plants that are suitable for all garden styles, bloom during
the same season, and have the same cultivation requirements as their nonnative counterparts. Plant entries are
accompanied by nature notes setting out the specific birds and butterflies the native plants attract.

The Midwestern Native Garden will be a welcome guide to gardeners whose styles range from formal to
naturalistic but who want to create an authentic sense of place, with regional natives. The beauty, hardiness,
and easy maintenance of native Midwestern plants will soon make them the new favorites.
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From reader reviews:

Ryan Pearson:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This
reading habit give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular
information inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what
kind of guide you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want feel
happy read one having theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Often the The Midwestern Native Garden:
Native Alternatives to Nonnative Flowers and Plants, an Illustrated Guide is kind of publication which is
giving the reader unstable experience.

Betty Abbott:

The publication with title The Midwestern Native Garden: Native Alternatives to Nonnative Flowers and
Plants, an Illustrated Guide has a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of profit after
read this book. This book exist new understanding the information that exist in this guide represented the
condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the
world. This specific book will bring you inside new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book on
your own smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Richard Dutton:

The particular book The Midwestern Native Garden: Native Alternatives to Nonnative Flowers and Plants,
an Illustrated Guide has a lot info on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of profit. The
book was published by the very famous author. The writer makes some research previous to write this book.
This book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after scanning this book.

Harry Blalock:

Is it you actually who having spare time after that spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Midwestern Native Garden:
Native Alternatives to Nonnative Flowers and Plants, an Illustrated Guide can be the response, oh how
comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this
brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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