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Throughout the colonial and antebellum periods, Virginia's tobacco producers exploited slave labor to ensure
the profitability of their agricultural enterprises. In the wake of the Civil War, however, the abolition of
slavery, combined with changed market conditions, sparked a breakdown of traditional tobacco culture.
Focusing on the transformation of social relations between former slaves and former masters, Jeffrey Kerr-
Ritchie traces the trajectory of this breakdown from the advent of emancipation to the stirrings of African
American migration at the turn of the twentieth century.
Drawing upon a rich array of sources, Kerr-Ritchie situates the struggles of newly freed people within the
shifting parameters of an older slave world, examines the prolonged agricultural depression and structural
transformation the tobacco economy underwent between the 1870s and 1890s, and surveys the effects of
these various changes on former masters as well as former slaves. While the number of older freedpeople
who owned small parcels of land increased phenomenally during this period, he notes, so too did the number
of freedom's younger generation who deserted the region's farms and plantations for Virginia's towns and
cities. Both these processes contributed to the gradual transformation of the tobacco region in particular and
the state in general.
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From reader reviews:

Effie Phillips:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Sure, you can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to
take a walk, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open as well as read a book eligible
Freedpeople in the Tobacco South: Virginia, 1860-1900? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You
already know beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before.
Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have various other opinion?

Kaye Hensley:

The book with title Freedpeople in the Tobacco South: Virginia, 1860-1900 has a lot of information that you
can learn it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This specific book exist new information the
information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u
to be aware of how the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you in new era of the
syndication. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Jeff Weaver:

It is possible to spend your free time to read this book this reserve. This Freedpeople in the Tobacco South:
Virginia, 1860-1900 is simple to bring you can read it in the area, in the beach, train along with soon. If you
did not have much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you
simpler to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits
that you will get when you buy this book.

Kimberly Silvestre:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is prepared or printed or descriptive from each source in which filled update of
news. On this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
trying to find the Freedpeople in the Tobacco South: Virginia, 1860-1900 when you required it?
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