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"We all think that management is a twentieth-century, newly invented skill, but its roots go back thousands
of years. This book is essential reading to learn that we cannont deal with today's problems without
understanding yesterday's." -- Leonard A. Lauder, President, Estee Lauder Companies "A classic way to
solve business problems." -- U.S. News & World Report In Homer's day, a hostile takeover meant blood and
arrows, not mergers and layoffs. However, The Iliad is still a valuable guide for steering the right course in
today's tricky business world. Shakespeare's King Lear has more to say about succession, delegation, and
decentralization than do most management texts. And Thoreau's "Walden" offers astute observations on what
can happen when an organization gets too big. Captivating and instructive, this book is the first to tap the
collective wisdom found in the classic works of Western literature and apply it to the problems of modern
managers and leaders. Drawing on sources that range from Homer's time to Arthur Miller's, this treasure
trove of passages and stories offers invaluable advice for solving today's most difficult business dilemmas. It
addresses such issues as building a team and keeping it together, managing an acquisition once it's in place,
eliminating daily distractions, and trusting your intuition. Whether you are reading these works for the first
time or are revisiting old favorites, The Classic Touch offers you a rich understanding of the art of leading.
John K. Clemens, professor of management at Hartwick College, is the founder and executive director of the
Hartwick Humanities in Management Institute, an organization that conducts leadership seminars for
emerging leaders in Fortune 500 companies. He is also the coauthor of Movies to Manage By: Lessons in
Leadership from Great Films. Douglas F. Mayer is the former chairman of the economics and management
department at Hartwick College. He is the coauthor of Shakespeare and Management--Othello, Macbeth, and
Lear: Lessons About Behavior in Organizations.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Matthews:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time? Yep,
you can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to
take a wander, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or even read a book titled The
Classic Touch: Lessons in Leadership from Homer to Hemingway? Maybe it is to get best activity for you.
You realize beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you
agree with the opinion or you have other opinion?

Latashia Bartlett:

This The Classic Touch: Lessons in Leadership from Homer to Hemingway book is absolutely not ordinary
book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book will be
information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper an individual read a
lot of information you will get. This specific The Classic Touch: Lessons in Leadership from Homer to
Hemingway without we realize teach the one who looking at it become critical in thinking and analyzing.
Don't possibly be worry The Classic Touch: Lessons in Leadership from Homer to Hemingway can bring
when you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it in
your lovely laptop even cellphone. This The Classic Touch: Lessons in Leadership from Homer to
Hemingway having fine arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not sense uninterested in
reading.

Pat Tran:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or
maybe playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity this is look different you can
read any book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent the
whole day to reading a publication. The book The Classic Touch: Lessons in Leadership from Homer to
Hemingway it is very good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. We were holding
enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the particular
e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book
provides high quality.

Frances York:

The Classic Touch: Lessons in Leadership from Homer to Hemingway can be one of your nice books that
are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary which
could increase your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the
information. The author giving his/her effort to put every word into delight arrangement in writing The



Classic Touch: Lessons in Leadership from Homer to Hemingway nevertheless doesn't forget the main place,
giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource information that maybe you can be one
among it. This great information can drawn you into completely new stage of crucial considering.
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