
The Diabetic Foot
Aziz Nather

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=B009QYIX46
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=B009QYIX46
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=B009QYIX46


The Diabetic Foot

Aziz Nather

The Diabetic Foot Aziz Nather

This book provides a comprehensive guide for all healthcare professionals managing diabetic foot problems
including general practitioners, nurses, podiatrists, orthopaedic surgeons, vascular surgeons and
endocrinologists. It is also written in an easy to read fashion so that patients and caregivers will also find it
useful.

It covers a wide range of topics on the Diabetic Foot starting with an Introductory Section on “Overview of
Diabetes”. Topics include ‘What is Diabetes?’, ‘Complications of Diabetes’ and ‘Management of Diabetes’.
The section on “Basic Science of Diabetic Foot” covers Anatomy, Biomechanics and Pathogenesis: the
Diabetes Foot Triad of Neuropathy, Vasculopathy and Immunopathy. Other Sections include Classification,
Clinical Presentation and Treatment.

A highlight of the book is the large “Guide to Operative Surgery” section. This section covers Major
Amputations, Minor Amputation and other Diabetic Foot Surgeries. The latter details Surgical Debridement
and Split Skin Grafting — two of the commonest operations performed. This operative manual is also useful
to residents and registrars.

The section on Wound Care has also been carefully assembled to meet the needs of nurses, podiatrists and
general practitioners, performing day to day dressing of diabetic wounds. It focuses on the use of New
Generation Dressings including Silver and Iodine Dressings and Advances in Wound Healing. Patients and
Care-givers will also find this useful.

The last section “A Patient's Guide” is especially written to benefit patients and care-givers. It includes ‘Care
of Diabetes’, ‘Care of the Foot’, ‘Choosing your own Footwear’, ‘Doing your own Dressing’ and
‘Rehabilitating your Below Knee Amputation’.

Finally, the Appendix includes details of the formation of NUH Diabetic Foot Team, Asia Pacific
Association of Diabetic Limb Problems and the ASEAN Plus Expert Group Forum on the Management of
Diabetic Foot Wounds.

Readership: Endocrinologists, orthopedic surgeons, podiatrists, infectious disease consults, nurse educators,
specialized wound care nurses, foot screen nurses, counselors, rehabilitation professionals, dietitians,
vascular surgeons and skin cover surgeons. Patients and caregivers dealing with the management of Diabetes



Foot Problems, undergraduate medical students and postgraduate students.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Sexton:

The book The Diabetic Foot will bring someone to the new experience of reading some sort of book. The
author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to study, this book very
appropriate to you. The book The Diabetic Foot is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the
e-book from the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Casey Timmons:

It is possible to spend your free time to study this book this reserve. This The Diabetic Foot is simple
bringing you can read it in the area, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not have much space to
bring the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save
typically the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this
book.

Felecia Holst:

Is it you actually who having spare time after that spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Diabetic Foot can be the respond to, oh
how comes? A book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand-
new era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Joshua Stickley:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got scholars? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. So you
know that little person such as reading or as studying become their hobby. You should know that reading is
very important as well as book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except
your own personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update about something by book. A substantial
number of sorts of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them are these claims The Diabetic
Foot.
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