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SPANISH: Una nueva y brillante traducción de los poemas de amor de Rumi. Un jardín más allá del paraíso
capta el espíritu de este poeta místico en un vibrante lenguaje, accesible al lector actual. Sus palabras nos
permiten sentir la intensa pasión y el ardiente deseo de unirnos al Amor. La poesía de Rumi es un camino
directo al Absoluto. Su versión de la unidad con Dios, radical y sorprendente, siempre ha caracterizado los
sueños más intrépidos del entendimiento humano y es la base del auténtico misticismo. Este material es de
alto voltaje. Léelo con cuidado. ENGLISH: A scintillating new rendition of the love poems of Rumi. A
Garden Beyond Paradise captures the spirit of this deeply mystical poet in vibrant language readily
accessible to he modern reader. His words enable us to feel the violent passion and burning desires for union
with the Beloved. Rumi's poetry is a direct line to the Absolute. His radical and sometimes shocking version
of oneness with God has always characterized the farthest reaches of human understanding and is the
foundation of all authentic mysticism. This is high-voltage material. Read with care.
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From reader reviews:

Caroline Petrie:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider when those information which is within the former life are challenging be find than now is taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you obtain
the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you.
All of those possibilities will not happen in you if you take Un jardin mas alla del paraiso - Poemas de Amor
de Rumi as your daily resource information.

Steven Cruce:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try and and must have the spare time or they will get
large amount of stress from both daily life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will
say absolutely of course. People is human not only a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you
have when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer can unlimited right. Then ever try this
one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the actual book you
have read is definitely Un jardin mas alla del paraiso - Poemas de Amor de Rumi.

Bonnie Daves:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this time you only find book that need
more time to be read. Un jardin mas alla del paraiso - Poemas de Amor de Rumi can be your answer mainly
because it can be read by anyone who have those short free time problems.

Cynthia Barksdale:

A number of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a book. They are directly felt that when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the actual book Un jardin mas alla del paraiso - Poemas de
Amor de Rumi to make your current reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading expertise is
developing when you including reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy you just read it
and mingle the opinion about book and reading through especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to
wide open a book and go through it. Beside that the publication Un jardin mas alla del paraiso - Poemas de
Amor de Rumi can to be your friend when you're experience alone and confuse with what must you're doing
of their time.
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