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Most people with any interest in the English language know that it has the worst alphabetic spelling system
in the world. What they don't know in any great detail, however, is how this sorry situation came about. They
don't know, for instance, that a 17th-century English schoolmaster named Edmund Coote had a major role.
And they might be surprised at the parts played by greed, intentional complexity, and downright blunders.
With this in mind, Niall McLeod Waldman has written Spelling Dearest. This book chronicles, in an
irreverent and satirical way, the major happenings and minor annoyances that together form the history of
English spelling. Starting with the Anglo-Saxon invasion of England in the fifth century, the book threads its
way through such noted historical events as the Renaissance, the Great Vowel Shift, and the birth of the
American dictionary. It shows the links spelling has with great individuals such as Noah Webster and Ben
Franklin. And not-so-great individuals such as Angus McLaughlin, who once said about English spelling, "If
it were any better, it would be rotten." Scattered throughout the book are illustrative charts, transcripts of
famous documents, and comical caricatures of the key people involved in this intriguing history. Spelling
Dearest is informative, insightful, outrageously contemptuous, and witty. It was written to appeal to anyone
who enjoys the challenge of, or has been frustrated by, English spelling - which covers just about everyone
who can read or write! A must-read for English language, history, or humor buffs.
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From reader reviews:

Gerard Williams:

This Spelling Dearest: The Down and Dirty, Nitty-Gritty History of English Spelling book is not really
ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is
usually information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper anyone
read a lot of information you will get. This specific Spelling Dearest: The Down and Dirty, Nitty-Gritty
History of English Spelling without we know teach the one who looking at it become critical in imagining
and analyzing. Don't always be worry Spelling Dearest: The Down and Dirty, Nitty-Gritty History of English
Spelling can bring once you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' become full because you can
have it with your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Spelling Dearest: The Down and Dirty, Nitty-Gritty
History of English Spelling having excellent arrangement in word and layout, so you will not truly feel
uninterested in reading.

Daphne Shew:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the subject Spelling
Dearest: The Down and Dirty, Nitty-Gritty History of English Spelling suitable to you? Typically the book
was written by well known writer in this era. The actual book untitled Spelling Dearest: The Down and
Dirty, Nitty-Gritty History of English Spellingis a single of several books in which everyone read now. This
particular book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter
the new age that you ever know previous to. The author explained their thought in the simple way, therefore
all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this e-book. This book will give you a wide range of
information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world within this book.

Ida Resler:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information easier
to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon.
You can observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to your account is Spelling Dearest: The Down and Dirty, Nitty-Gritty History of English
Spelling this publication consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This kind of
book was represented how can the world has grown up. The words styles that writer value to explain it is
easy to understand. Typically the writer made some analysis when he makes this book. Here is why this book
ideal all of you.

Bonnie Wilson:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is composed or printed or highlighted from each source which filled update of news. In this



particular modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social including newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
searching for the Spelling Dearest: The Down and Dirty, Nitty-Gritty History of English Spelling when you
necessary it?
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