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While America is not alone in its ambivalence toward sex, its preferences swing sharply between toleration
and censure. This pattern has grown even more pronounced since the 1960s, with the emergence of the New
Right and its attack on the "floodtide of filth" supposedly sweeping the nation. Antipornography campaigns
became the New Right's political capital in the 1960s, laying the groundwork for the "family values" agenda
that shifted the country to the right. Perversion of Profit traces the anatomy of this trend, conducting archival
research in twenty-four states and recounting the debates over obscenity that consumed members of the
ACLU in the 1950s, the deployment of obscenity charges against gay media during the cold war, and the rise
of the influential Citizens for Decent Literature during the 1960s.

Whitney Strub illustrates the crucial function of pornography in constructing the New Right agenda, which
emphasized social issues over racial and economic inequality. He situates the fight over obscenity within the
politics of 1950s pop culture and the pivotal events that followed: the sexual revolution, feminist activism,
the "porno chic" moment of the early 1970s, and resurgent Christian conservatism, which now shapes public
policy far beyond the issue of sexual decency. Following these battles to the early months of the Obama
administration, Strub isolates the undercurrents of anti-Communist rhetoric that once powered the
antipornography movement and continues to permeate political discourse. Connecting the lowest forms of
entertainment to the highest levels of government, he revolutionizes our understanding of sex and American
politics.
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From reader reviews:

Celia Robertson:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also become a life style. This reading behavior give you
lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book in which
improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of book you read, if
you want send more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want feel happy read one together
with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The particular Perversion for Profit: The Politics of
Pornography and the Rise of the New Right is kind of book which is giving the reader unpredictable
experience.

Ernest Tate:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the extra time or they
will get wide range of stress from both everyday life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra
time, we will say absolutely indeed. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what
kind of activity do you possess when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will unlimited
right. Then do you ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare
time, the book you have read is actually Perversion for Profit: The Politics of Pornography and the Rise of
the New Right.

Derick Heinz:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this Perversion for Profit: The Politics of
Pornography and the Rise of the New Right e-book written by well-known writer who knows well how to
make book which might be understand by anyone who read the book. Written throughout good manner for
you, leaking every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still skepticism
Perversion for Profit: The Politics of Pornography and the Rise of the New Right as good book not simply by
the cover but also from the content. This is one e-book that can break don't judge book by its include, so do
you still needing a different sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already said so
why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

Donald Barber:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This specific book Perversion for Profit: The Politics of Pornography
and the Rise of the New Right was colourful and of course has pictures around. As we know that book
Perversion for Profit: The Politics of Pornography and the Rise of the New Right has many kinds or type.
Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and think you are the
character on there. So , not at all of book are make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and rest.
Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading this.
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