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Today many view Sigmund Freud as an elitist whose psychoanalytic treatment was reserved for the
intellectually and financially advantaged. However, in this new work Elizabeth Ann Danto presents a
strikingly different picture of Freud and the early psychoanalytic movement. Danto recovers the neglected
history of Freud and other analysts' intense social activism and their commitment to treating the poor and
working classes.

Danto's narrative begins in the years following the end of World War I and the fall of the Habsburg Empire.
Joining with the social democratic and artistic movements that were sweeping across Central and Western
Europe, analysts such as Freud, Wilhelm Reich, Erik Erikson, Karen Horney, Erich Fromm, and Helene
Deutsch envisioned a new role for psychoanalysis. These psychoanalysts saw themselves as brokers of social
change and viewed psychoanalysis as a challenge to conventional political and social traditions. Between
1920 and 1938 and in ten different cities, they created outpatient centers that provided free mental health
care. They believed that psychoanalysis would share in the transformation of civil society and that these new
outpatient centers would help restore people to their inherently good and productive selves.

Drawing on oral histories and new archival material, Danto offers vivid portraits of the movement's central
figures and their beliefs. She explores the successes, failures, and challenges faced by free institutes such as
the Berlin Poliklinik, the Vienna Ambulatorium, and Alfred Adler's child-guidance clinics. She also
describes the efforts of Wilhelm Reich's Sex-Pol, a fusion of psychoanalysis and left-wing politics, which
provided free counseling and sex education and aimed to end public repression of private sexuality.

In addition to situating the efforts of psychoanalysts in the political and cultural contexts of Weimar
Germany and Red Vienna, Danto also discusses the important treatments and methods developed during this
period, including child analysis, short-term therapy, crisis intervention, task-centered treatment, active
therapy, and clinical case presentations. Her work illuminates the importance of the social environment and
the idea of community to the theory and practice of psychoanalysis.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Lowe:

Inside other case, little persons like to read book Freud's Free Clinics: Psychoanalysis & Social Justice,
1918-1938. You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. Provided that we know about
how is important any book Freud's Free Clinics: Psychoanalysis & Social Justice, 1918-1938. You can add
expertise and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can know
everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple issue until wonderful
thing you could know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or perhaps searching by internet system. It
is called e-book. You may use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's read.

David Guyton:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Make
an effort to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't assess book by its cover may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the
outside look likes. Maybe you answer might be Freud's Free Clinics: Psychoanalysis & Social Justice, 1918-
1938 why because the great cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint an
individual. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will
directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Jewel Tarr:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make anyone to
understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information quicker to share. You
can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon. You can view that
now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The particular book that recommended to you
personally is Freud's Free Clinics: Psychoanalysis & Social Justice, 1918-1938 this e-book consist a lot of
the information from the condition of this world now. This book was represented how does the world has
grown up. The language styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made
some study when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book suited all of you.

Jerry Bonner:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen will need book to know the change information of year to help year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. With the book Freud's Free Clinics: Psychoanalysis & Social Justice, 1918-1938 we can take more
advantage. Don't that you be creative people? To get creative person must like to read a book. Just simply
choose the best book that suited with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life with that book
Freud's Free Clinics: Psychoanalysis & Social Justice, 1918-1938. You can more inviting than now.
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