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Poetry/Spanish (untranslated), English and Spanglish. First published in 1984 by Arte Publico, Shaking Off
the Dark has become one of the classics of Chicano literature. This new, corrected edition features poems not
included in the first edition, as well as an introduction and bibilography. These poems are thoughtful, angry,
perceptive, and address such topics as art, time, love, oppression, history, and language itself.
"Distraught,/mad-eyed from told formulas/bound to rule my easy ways,/I look, I see,/but fail once more to
know." In his "failure" to know, however, Villanueva provides us a gorgeous window onto the worlds he
sees so sharply. "So arise, Chicano," he extorts, "arise from the shadow of Nothingness;/arise from that
neverending Nada of servitude./The problem is we live by other people's words" (from "Speak Up, Chicano,
Speak Up"). Villanueva does speak up, creating poems to counter "other people's words." A recipient of the
American Book Award, Villanueva lives in Boston and teaches at Boston University.
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From reader reviews:

Kim McLoughlin:

Book will be written, printed, or created for everything. You can learn everything you want by a reserve.
Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important issue to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A publication Shaking Off the Dark (Clasicos
Chicanos) will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about
every thing. But some of you think in which open or reading a new book make you bored. It isn't make you
fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or suited book with you?

Frank Hudson:

What do you concerning book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you need something
to explain what the one you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man or woman? If
you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have extra
time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They have to answer that question
simply because just their can do this. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
suitable. Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need that Shaking Off the Dark (Clasicos
Chicanos) to read.

Marilyn McDermott:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the title Shaking Off the Dark
(Clasicos Chicanos) suitable to you? The book was written by famous writer in this era. Often the book
untitled Shaking Off the Dark (Clasicos Chicanos)is the one of several books that will everyone read now.
This kind of book was inspired many people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the new
way of measuring that you ever know prior to. The author explained their thought in the simple way,
consequently all of people can easily to understand the core of this e-book. This book will give you a large
amount of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world on this book.

Andrew Gillon:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from a book. Book is written or printed or highlighted from each source in which filled update of
news. With this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you. From media
social just like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
seeking the Shaking Off the Dark (Clasicos Chicanos) when you essential it?
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