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Em memória da devoção e da coragem. O livro dos mártires é um clássico da literatura mundial, ignorado até
há pouco tempo pelos cristãos do Brasil. O livro reconta as vidas, os sofrimentos e as mortes triunfantes dos
mártires cristãos da História. Iniciando-se com a história do primeiro mártir - o próprio Jesus Cristo - este
relato histórico excepcional traça as raízes da perseguição religiosa. Expõe os casos de mártires famosos
como John Wyckliff, John Huss, William Tyndale, Martinho Lutero, Thomas Cranmer e muitos outros. Por
que ler esta obra em pleno século 21? Infelizmente o tema do martírio religioso recusa-se a ser relegado aos
arquivos da História. É assunto tão contemporâneo quanto as manchetes de hoje. Cristãos em diversos países
hoje vivem e defendem a sua fé sob a ameaça de morte. Muitos acabam pagando o preço máximo. E cada
uma dessas mortes suscita uma interrogação na consciência de todo cristão: o que eu faria no seu lugar? A
reflexão inspirada pela morte dos mártires pode nos levar ao cerne da nossa fé. Esta nova edição conta com a
tradução primorosa de Almiro Pisetta e litogravuras originais de Marcelo Moscheta.
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From reader reviews:

Anthony Robin:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add
your knowledge by the book entitled O livro dos mártires: 1 (Clássicos MC) (Portuguese Edition). Try to
make book O livro dos mártires: 1 (Clássicos MC) (Portuguese Edition) as your pal. It means that it can for
being your friend when you truly feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than previously.
Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you considerably more confidence because you
can know almost everything by the book. So , let's make new experience as well as knowledge with this
book.

Donald Pate:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the spare time or they
will get great deal of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , if we ask do people have extra time, we will
say absolutely of course. People is human not really a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity are
you experiencing when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will probably unlimited right.
Then do you ever try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time,
the actual book you have read is O livro dos mártires: 1 (Clássicos MC) (Portuguese Edition).

Patrick Bergeron:

Within this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more special
than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you have to do is
just spending your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of the books in the
top listing in your reading list is usually O livro dos mártires: 1 (Clássicos MC) (Portuguese Edition). This
book and that is qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in turning into precious person. By
looking way up and review this guide you can get many advantages.

Allen Green:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by online on social media. You
can choose the most beneficial book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever simply by searching from
it. It is referred to as of book O livro dos mártires: 1 (Clássicos MC) (Portuguese Edition). You can include
your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make
anyone happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one place
to other place.
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