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The Fairy Houses wall calendar reveals a magical world of handcrafted faerie castles and cottages, fanciful
fairy retreats and sanctuaries, and habitable hobbit hideaways. Celebrated environmental artist Sally J. Smith
builds these exquisite creations from materials found in the wild. Each house begins as a collection of bark,
twigs, mosses, and stones and is finished with touches of fragile blossoms, ferns, and butterfly wings that add
to their ethereal beauty. When complete, the houses are placed in a natural setting so perfectly suited that
they seem surely to have been crafted by fairy hands.

A year of fantastic fairy houses on your wall.●

Frameable artbook-quality printing.●

The perfect gift for the fantasy, fairy tale, and nature art lover.●

Exceptional photographs of magical fairy houses in forests and fields.●

Printed on FSC® Certified Mixed Source Paper with soy-based inks.●

Published by Amber Lotus, an independent carbon-negative US company that has planted more than half a●

million trees since 2008.
This calendar features US and Canadian legal holidays, phases of the moon, and important observances of●

the world's major religions.

Children and adults alike will find inspiration and delight in this creative expression of land art.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Slowik:

This Fairy Houses 2017 Wall Calendar tend to be reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful
person, why. The key reason why of this Fairy Houses 2017 Wall Calendar can be one of the great books
you must have is definitely giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed an individual with
information that maybe will shock your before knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it
everywhere you go and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed people. Beside that this
Fairy Houses 2017 Wall Calendar giving you an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary,
giving you trial of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day action. So , let's have it
appreciate reading.

Herman Lewis:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book so.
There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new facts. When
you read a reserve you will get new information due to the fact book is one of many ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, looking at a book will make a person more imaginative. When you
examining a book especially hype book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the characters do
it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Fairy Houses 2017
Wall Calendar, you could tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours book. Your knowledge
can inspire different ones, make them reading a publication.

Gina Keller:

The book untitled Fairy Houses 2017 Wall Calendar contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains
her idea with easy approach. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do certainly not
worry, you can easy to read that. The book was compiled by famous author. The author will bring you in the
new period of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or
program, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book,
you can open up their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice study.

Donald Ventura:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got college students? We believe that that
concern was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby.
And also you know that little person including reading or as looking at become their hobby. You should
know that reading is very important along with book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update about something by book.
Amount types of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is Fairy Houses 2017 Wall
Calendar.
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