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Since the 1970s, the U.S. economy has been sending more and more of its rewards to fewer and fewer
people. Once seen as a global exemplar of egalitarianism and middle-class opportunity, America has become
the most unequal of developed nations—a land where corporate leaders earn hundreds of times the pay of
average workers, and the only population group growing faster than millionaires is the uninsured. Statistics
aside, this quarte-century-long trend has changed the texture of American life in ways that threaten our
deepest values.

Drawing on the best and latest research, the contributors explore issues such as the real story the numbers tell
about how America has changed; dimensions of inequality (education, health, and opportunity); causes of
inequality, looking past the usual suspects of technology, trade, and immigration; the persistence of racial
disparities; the erosion of democracy and community; and inequality as a moral and religious problem. Not
just a catalog of inequality’s ills, the book concludes with a plausible and hopeful policy path—beyond
redistribution—to a more just and humane economy.
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From reader reviews:

Jean Young:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be up-date about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era that is certainly always change and make progress.
Some of you maybe will update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice in your case but the
problems coming to you is you don't know which one you should start with. This Inequality Matters: The
Growing Economic Divide in America and Its Poisonous Consequences is our recommendation so you keep
up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Mark Carter:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold
on guys this aren't like that. This Inequality Matters: The Growing Economic Divide in America and Its
Poisonous Consequences book is readable simply by you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the
data here are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge
that want to give to you. The writer of Inequality Matters: The Growing Economic Divide in America and Its
Poisonous Consequences content conveys thinking easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-
book are not different in the written content but it just different available as it. So , do you continue to
thinking Inequality Matters: The Growing Economic Divide in America and Its Poisonous Consequences is
not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Christopher Palmer:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't evaluate book by its include may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the
outside appear likes. Maybe you answer can be Inequality Matters: The Growing Economic Divide in
America and Its Poisonous Consequences why because the great cover that make you consider about the
content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or even cover.
Your reading sixth sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Roberta Lawrence:

You can spend your free time to read this book this book. This Inequality Matters: The Growing Economic
Divide in America and Its Poisonous Consequences is simple bringing you can read it in the recreation area,
in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not have got much space to bring the actual printed book, you
can buy the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone.
So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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