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Who's bearing gifts this Christmas? Three hot, single guys!

Christy de la Cruz has it all: a great career as an interior designer for the stylish homes of New Mexico,
marriage to a tall and handsome man, and a great family—especially her cousin Maggie. But as the holidays
approach, she's down to two out of three—that handsome husband has walked out the door. Christy is so not
up for dating . . . until Maggie takes Christy on as the ultimate romantic project. Just like the wise men in the
nativity story, Melchior, Caspar, and Balthazar arrive bearing gifts and displaying their best stuff. One's a
pretty boy, one's a rugged cowboy, and one's an animal lover. Which one will win Christy's heart?

Everyone Loves Alisa Valdes-Rodriguez's Novels!

"Intoxicating."—New York Post

"Exhilarating."—Jennifer Crusie

"Must-haves."—Latina magazine
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From reader reviews:

Nicole Rockwood:

Now a day people who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources inside it can be true or not require people to be aware of each facts they get. How individuals to
be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information especially this The Three Kings: A Christmas
Dating Story book as this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred
percent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Elsie Canada:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the extra time or they will get
great deal of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , if we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely
sure. People is human not just a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity have you got when the spare
time coming to anyone of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then do you try this one,
reading guides. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, often the book you have read will
be The Three Kings: A Christmas Dating Story.

Ellis Cook:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book mainly book entitled
The Three Kings: A Christmas Dating Story the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in
every aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging every word written
in a e-book then become one type conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get previous to. The The
Three Kings: A Christmas Dating Story giving you another experience more than blown away your head but
also giving you useful details for your better life in this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern here
is your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a sport. Do
you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Barbara Norwood:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book
compared to can satisfy your short period of time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve that
need more time to be go through. The Three Kings: A Christmas Dating Story can be your answer since it
can be read by a person who have those short spare time problems.
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